To:  Lesiey Gror [

From: bellaklein
Sent: Fri 5/16/2014 8:43:18 PM
Subject: Re:

paid, will have the report ready on monday.
Thank you,
Bella

On May 16, 2014, at 4:14 PM, Lesley Groff || G- o

Hello Dr. Fallahpour...Bella in our accounting dept will call and give youa CC #.
I will circle back to you on Monday re the documents!

Thanks and have a great weekend.
Lesley

On May 16, 2014, at 4:11 PM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation gmail com=> wrote:

yes

On Fri, May 16, 2014 at 4:06 PM, Lesley Groft </ G o

OK to give CC to Dr, Fallahpour to pay the balance of $1000

Begin forwarded message:

From: GG

Date: May 16, 51 EDT

Godo Afternocon!

[ was emailing pou fo gel a conlact number 5o [ can speak with you about -'r1"e are fnalizing the report
and will have it by Monday but there is 8 balance of £1,000.00 i you couwld just call

mg with & ¢ pumber that would be greal.
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Thank You

Harleyann Diaz-MacKenzie

Brain Resource Center

263 West End Ave Suite #1D
023

please note
The mformation contamed in this communication 18
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawtul. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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