
To: 
Fran: 
Sent Mon 5/§/a14 3:51:43 PM 
Subject: Re: Ty =Outstanding Balance? 

tremendous! I will ! thanks so much 
On May 5, 2014, at 11:50 AM, Anne Tomaselli a wrote: 

Yyour all set. I see that he is registered for week June 23 - 27. You can go back into the 
system and now pay by credit card 

On Mon, May 5, 2014 at 11:44 AM, ‹ > wrote: 

thanks Mike...I will await to hear back 
On May 5, 2014, at 11:42 AM, Mike Evans <WINI.mINIm > 
wrote: 

Anne, 
See below. This is my fault, I realize. I should have kept better track of the cash. 

What can we do for her? 
Thanks, 
Mike 

 Forwarded messa e 
From: 
Date: Mon Ivity_5, 2014 at 11:25 AM 
Subject:E=Outstanding Balance? 
To 

Hi Mike...Hope you are well. I want to sign I up for basketball camp the week of 
June 23-27, but when I go to pay, it states I have an outstanding 
balance of $160 for February Basketball camp!? ey attended the 
basketball camp only on Feb. 21st and we paid for it with cash...Can 
you please check in to this or give me the name/phone #/email 
address of the person I should speak to so we may have this balance 
taken off our account? I can't signs up for the summer camp until 
this is taken care of. 

Thanks so much for your help. 
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Mike Evans 
Right Angle Shooting 
www.rightangleshooting.com 

Thanks and Go Rams!! 

Annie 
Anne Tomaselli 

Assistant to the Athletics birector 

NCHS Athletics 

11 Farm Road 

New Canaan, CT 
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