To:
From:
Sent: Mon 4/28/2014 1:13:51 PM

Subject: Re: New Pricing

great!! 1 am in the process of getting quotes from moving companies now...we need our CO and
several things still need to get done. . .1 am shooting for May 29th...! If we can install before we
move in, that would be great. What do you think?

On Apr 28, 2014, at 7:41 AM, —wmlc:

Excellent!

Everything is om order. The shutter will take longer than the blinds. T will follow up with vou in a few weeks
when things start amving. Do you have a move in date vet?

----- Original Message-----

From
Sent: Saturday, April 26, 2014 09:48 AM
To:

Subject: Re: New Pricing

All this is correct! Do place the order with the Amex number i gave you! Allis a go!

On Apr 25, 2014, at 6:46 PM, | o<

Hi -

Attached is your invoice for the window treatments. Thank you so much for the order. Please review
and just sent me back an email confirming and 1 will release your order,

1 will have to put this through on the Amex you gave me to Costeo, That is what they require. You will
be getting a $200.00 Costeo cash card as well. Please let me know if you have any questions
and have a greatl weekend!!

Carol

Carol Tomassetti

FRAME Creations

18 Huntington Plaza

Shelon, CT 06454

fax

-----Original Message-----
From:
Sent: Wednesday, April 23, 2014 03:55 PM
To I
Subject: Re: New Pricing

-

EFTA_R1_00723267
EFTA02106912



Hi Carol...I would like to get started on my order with you! Do you need to send out
someone to measure our master bath for the shutter? That is what | would like to do if it
will clear that faucet...or perhaps the shutter should be an 1/8" shorter or something?

Also, you measured the 2 little windows in the guest room...what was the price tag for
them?

I rec'd the fabric swatches for Ty's room (thank you!) I am still contemplating on what
to do there...

What is the next step to proceed? I know I signed some paper work and gave you my
CC# and Coscto #...All are eligible for the Costco Gift Card, correct? Below is what |
would like:

Master Bedroom: black out shade w/clutch nght cord $750.00

Master Bath: Shutter $450.00

Ty's Bath: 2.5" comp. wood blind $159.00

Nanny Room and Bath: 2" composite blinds $395.00

Downstairs Bath Off Kitchen: 2 3/8" painted wood blind $175.00

Guest Room: 2 little windows 777 (you had quoted approx. $190.00)

Thanks, Lesley

On Apr 12, 2014, at 1:25 PM.__ wrote:

You should have them Thursday or Friday. Let me know if you don't have
them by then.

Caml

Carol Tomassetti
FRAME Creations
18 Huntington Plaza
Shelton, CT 06484

'-||]"- WWW IRnecTealions, com

-----0riginal Message-----
From:
Sent: Saturday, April 12, 2014 01:12 PM

o
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Subject: Re: New Pricing

Great! thank you for this! Need to mull it all over...please send the samples to:

L
120 Oak Street
Mew Canaan, CT 06840

I have a sample of the carpet we are installing in Ty's room and definticly want to look at
this stuff all together. When should I expect to see the samples?

Have a great weekend! -

On Apr 12, 2014, at 12:11 PN.I,_ wrote:

Hi Leslie,
I hope you are having a good weekend. Here is the pricing we discsused yesterday:
I'v's Room - Arched shutters, installed, with Hide A Tilt - $3,200,00 (2 1/2" painted wood)
Blackout drapenies with satin nickel hardware, mstalled - $2,500.00 (Jeffersen Linen/Gray, or
Carrara’Sterling

Your Bathroom shutter - Composite, Silk White, Bi-Fold with Hide A Tilt - $450.00

Let me know what you think. [ will send you samples of the drapery fabric, but what address to vou
want them sent too?

Carol

Carol Tomassetti
FRAME Creations
18 Huntington Plaza
Shelton, CT 06484

|'.i.|E| www framecrealions, com
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