To:

From: Cabaret House Seats

Sent: Tue 4/22/2014 9:34:54 PM
Subject: RE: Cabaret House Seats May 31

Is this for the matinee or evening performance for Saturday May 3177

Best,

Lauren

From: [mailto

Sent: Tuesday, April 22, 2014 12:28 PM
To: Cabaret House Seats

Subject: Re: Cabaret House Seats May 31

Security Code on Jeffrey Epstein's card is:-

On Apr 22, 2014, at 10:39 AM, Cabaret House Scats
<(abarctHouseScats{roundabouttheatre.org> wrote:

Hi All,

Please note Monday is our day off and this email does not get checked.,

We need the following information to set up house seats. The cost per ticket is $162.00 each.

* Date/ftime of performance:

* Number of tickets:

* Name under which tickets should be held at box office:
* Credit card number:

* Credit card expiration date:

* Name on card:
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* Billing zip:
= Card security code:

Thanks,
Roseanna

Roseanna Sharrow

Company Manager — Cabaret

From: Amanda Skarbnik [mailto
Sent: Monday, April 21, :
To: Cabaret House Seats;
Subject: RE: Cabaret House Sea

Hi Roseanna,

'm just following up with this request. | left you a voicemail, but assume email is best. Please allow
o give you the credit card information to confirm her purchase of the 4 house seat tickets to

Cabaret on May 31.

Thank you!

All the best,

Amanda

Amanda Skarbnik
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Assistant to Peggy Siegal
Peggy Siegal Company
750 Lexington Avenue
5" Floor

New York, NY 10022

From: Amanda Skarbnik

Sent: Monday, April 21, 2 -
To: "Cabaret House Seats'

—

Subject: RE: Cabaret Ho

Hi Roseanna,

| am attaching Mr. Epstein’s assistan
information to confirm payment for the 4 house seats to Cabaret on May 317,

Please Iet-know what information you may need to confirm everything. Thank you.

All the best,

Amanda

Amanda Skarbnik
Assistant to Peggy Siegal
Peggy Siegal Company
750 Lexington Avenue

5" Floor

on this reply. She can provide you with credit card
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MNew York, NY 10022

From: Cabaret House Seats [mailto:CabaretHouseSeats@roundabouttheatre.org]
Sent: Wednesday, April 16, 2014 1:10 PM

To: Amanda Skarbnik

Subject: RE: Cabaret House Seats May 31

No, we cannot.
The maximum for any order is 4 tickets. We cannot accommodate larger orders than 4.

Thanks,
Roseanna

Roseanna Sharrow

Company Manager = Cabaret

From: Amanda Skarbnik [mﬂg_
Sent: Wednesday, April 16, 2019°1%

To: Cabaret House Seats

Subject: RE: Cabaret House Seats May 31

Okay thank you, would you be able to do 8 house seats if they are not together? Let me know.

All the best,

Amanda
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Amanda Skarbnik
Assistant to Peggy Siegal
Peggy Siegal Company
750 Lexington Avenue
5" Floor

Mew York, NY 10022

From: Cabaret House Seats [mailto:CabaretHouseSeats@roundabouttheatre.org]
Sent: Wednesday, April 16, 2014 12:58 PM

To: Amanda Skarbnik

Subject: RE: Cabaret House Seats May 31

Hi Amanda,

We would only be able to accommodate 4 Seat total for either the matinee or the evening performance
on May 31,

Please just send all of the details if that works for you.

Thanks,
Roseanna

Roseanna Sharrow

Company Manager — Cabaret

From: Amanda Skarbnik [mailto:siegalassist@pegaysiegal.com]
Sent: Tuesday, April 15, 2014 1:59 PM

To: Cabaret House Seats

Subject: Cabaret House Seats May 31
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Hello,

| just wanted to follow up with this request. Please confirm. Thank you very much.

I'm reaching out to request 8 house seat tickets for Cabaret on Saturday, May 31*, Thank you!

All the best,

Amanda

Amanda Skarbnik
Assistant to Peggy Siegal
Peggy Siegal Company
750 Lexington Avenue
5" Floor

New York, NY 10022

From: Amanda Skarbnik

Sent: Monday, April 14, 2014 2:55 PM

To: rethous droun ré.or
Subject: Cabaret House Seats May 31

Hello,

Hope you are well. I'm reaching out to request 8 house seat tickets for Cabaret on Saturday, May 31%
Thank you!
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All the best,

Amanda

Amanda Skarbnik
Assistant to Peggy Siegal
Peggy Siegal Company
750 Lexington Avenue
5" Floor

New York, NY 10022
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