. ellakiein
Sent: Tue 4/29/2014 3:49:30 PM
Subject: Re: Met Gala | Cocktails Only

Hi Eaddy,
Please see attached check. It wall be mailed today.

Thank you,

Bella
On Apr 29, 2014, at 10:26 AM, "Kiernan, L-'addy"_ wrote:

Dear Bella,
Please find the invoice attached here. Could you kindly confirm receipt?

All the best,
Eaddy

Eaddy Kiernan

Special Events Associate
VOGLUE

4 Times Square, 12th Floor
New Yaork, New York 10036

From: Amanda Skarbm
Date: Thursday, April
To: Conde Nast
Subject: RE: Met Gala | Cocktails Only
Hi Eaddy,

Bella Klein, on behalf of Jeffrey Epstein, will give you all the information you need. |
have CC'd her here and her contact number is below.
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All the best,
Amanda

Amanda Skarbnik
Assistant to Peggy Siegal
Peggy Siegal Company
750 Lexington Avenue
5" Floor

New York, NY 10022

From: iermen, odoy (i1
Sent: Thursday, April 24, 2014 12:11
To: Amanda Skarbnik

Cc: Pape, Sophie; Ramazi, Lilah
Subject: Met Gala | Cocktails Only

Dear Amanda,

Could you please provide the billing contact for Peggy's invoice? It will be sent via email,
but the Museum still needs a copy of the billing mailing address for their records.

All the best,

Eaddy

Eaddy Kiernan

Special Events Associate
VOGUE

4 Times Square, 12th Floor
New York, New York 10036
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