To: |
From:
Sent: Mon 4/21/2014 9:38:33 PM

Subject: Re:

! We do have an apt for you the May 3 (out may 47). You will stay in apt 10B, door code
18 Please let me know you approximate arrival and departure times when you know them!
.. And Jeffrey did not reply to your offer to help pay for the maid. I think it is just all part of the
nice deal! But thank you for offering!

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 18, 2014, at 10:04 AM, "Gerald Barmn"_ wrote:

It was such a joy for the family to have an opportunity to use an apartment this week. The use
of one of the apartments, when available, is a gracious gift and much appreciated. While there
is no way | could compensate you or Jeffrey on the total capital cost, it seems fair that | could
pay for the marginal cost of my stay when an apartment is available, i.e., maid's clean-up cost.
If you agree with this, please let me know. Certainly such a token payment would not diminish
my appreciation for the opportunity.

If you have an apartment available on May 3, it would be much appreciated. If not, it will be
totally understood.

| hope_ and the spring weather allows us to get
outside. Thanks again.

Jerry

Gerald G. Barton
Landmark Land Company, Inc.
P.O. Box 1880

Upper 3
Phone:
Fax:
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DISCLAIMER: This e-mail message, including any attached files and subsequent replies,
is intended only for the exclusive use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed
and may contain information that is proprietary, privileged, confidential and/or exempt
from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this e-mail message is not the
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