
To: Amanda Skarbnik sie alassist a si al.com] 
Cc: 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Thur 4/24/2014 11:57:09 AM 
Subject: Re: Cabaret tickets 

Morning Amanda! I asked Jeffrey about using amc and CC # as a new guest 
requesting 4 house scats and he said do it!! Yae. So have Roseanne email sue rc all the info she 
needs and I think this will work! Ms ce'd here 

Also, Jeffrey said yes to the 55000 for the Anna Wintour cocktails! I told Rich or Bella to reach 
out to you on this. ! 

Rich: 
Bella: 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 23, 2014, at 6:03 PM, Amanda Skarbnik rote: 

It's worth a shot! We can scheme more tomorrow. Our ticket broker told me to check 
back again tomorrow.. 

All the best, 
Amanda 

Amanda Skarbnik 
Assistant to Peggy Siegal 

From: Lesley Groff [mailto:le5leV.ieeftnmail.rom]
Sent: Wednesday, April 23, 2014 4:28 PM 
To: Amanda Skarbnik 
Subject: Re: Cabaret tickets 

ah! I actually think that is a great idea...it is sneaky...but ...let me ask Jeffrey if he is 
ok with putting under another name and CC#...would Peggy be ok with this? 

On Apr 23, 2014, at 4:16 PM, Amanda Skarbnik wrote: 

Oh my!! Hopefully we figure this out soon. 
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Another option I was thinking- but I'm not sure if it would work. Would be to be sneaky 
and place a separate request to the Cabaret house ticket person, Roseanna. She only 
was able to give 4 per person but maybe if we requested under a different name we 
could finagle it? Just trying to weigh out our options.. 

All the best, 
Amanda 

Amanda Skarbnik 
Assistant to Peggy Siegal 
Pe Sie al Com an 

From: Lesley Groff [mailto:leslev.ieeftmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 23, 2014 4:12 PM 
To: Amanda Skarbnik 
Subject: Re: Cabaret tickets 

super thanks 
I called around...one scalper told me only mezzanine is available...no more 
tables...but then another scalper said he could get a table of 4 for S750 per a ticket! 
yikes!... 

On Apr 23, 2014, at 4:07 PM, Amanda Skarbnik wrote: 

Just spoke to him an hour or two ago and he told me he would get back to me this 
afternoon. I'll try again in an hour and try to light a fire under his feet. 

Also, I am going to follow up with Alan Cumming and Hylda Queally from the 
production. 

All the best, 
Amanda 

Amanda Skarbnik 
Assistant to Peggy Siegal 

From: Lesley Groff [mailto:leslev.ieeftgmail.corn]
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Sent: Wednesday, April 23, 2014 4:06 PM 
To: Amanda Skarbnik 
Subject: Re: Cabaret tickets 

HI Amanda...any word from your ticket broker...? :) 

On Apr 23, 2014, at 10:45 AM, Amanda Skarbnik wrote: 

Okay great, glad to hear it! It's no problem at all. Our ticket broker said we would hear 
back today, I will keep you posted. 

All the best, 
Amanda 

Amanda Skarbnik 
Assistant to Peggy Siegal 

From: Lesley Groff [madto:lesley.tee@omail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 23, 2014 10:41 AM 
To: Amanda Skarbnik 
Subject: Re: Cabaret tickets 

Ycs! I rec;d confirmation last night...thank you so very much...i am going to call 
my scalper today also and see if they can get them...really appreciate you running 
around for JE... 

On Apr 23, 2014, at 10:38 AM, Amanda Skarbnik wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 

Was everything find in confirming the purchase of those 4 tickets? I am following up in 
trying to get the other 4 today. 

All the best, 
Amanda 
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Amanda Skarbnik 
Assistant to Peggy Siegal 
1/1 
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