From:
Sent: Wed 4/23/2014 2:40:47 PM

Subject: Re: Cabaret tickets

Yes! | rec;d confirmation last night...thank you so very much...i am going to call my scalper

today also and see if they can get them.. really appreciate you running around for JE...
On Apr 23, 2014, at 10:38 AM, Amanda Skarbnik wrote:

Was everything find in confirming the purchase of those 4 tickets? | am following up in

trying to get the other 4 today.

All the best,
Amanda

Amanda Skarbnik
Assistant to Peggy Siegal
Pe Siepal Company
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