
To: 
From: 
Sent Wed 4/9/2014 7:40:52 PM 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein Amex Charge 

All the girls. 

Sent from my iPhone 

er .On Apr 9, 2014, at 3:36 PM, bellaklein wrote:

Him 
Can you think who would be with JE when he purchased the art? 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Elizabeth Hobson 
Subject: RE: Jeffrey Epsiliri n 
Date: April 9, 2014 11:56:55 AM EDT 
To: 
Cc: 

Bella -
We're looking into it. As for the table, the only payment I've 
received was the check you sent. I believe this may be 
art-work purchases the night of, but am looking through 
paperwork this morning. 
Will let you know asap. 
Best, 
Liz 

Elizabeth B. Hobson, CMP 

Academy Events & Exhibitions: 
TRIBECA BALL supported by van Cleef & Arpels - Monday, April 7 
MFA Open Studios - Friday, April 25, 6-9pm 
2014 MFA Thesis Exhibition - May 20-June 7 

Academy Blog: 
Official Facebook pa e: 
Follow us on Twitte 
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From: bellaklein 
Sent: Wednesday, April 09, 201 
To: Elizabeth Hobson 
Cc: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Jeffrey Epstein Amex Charge 

Hi Liz, 
Please provide backup for the following Amex Charge. It is confusing 
as I mailed a check from Enhanced Ed for same amount. 

NEW YORK ACADEMY OF NEW YORK NY JEFFREY E EPSTEIN 

Thank you for your help, 
Bella 
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