To: Burke Enterprises, Inc. KGN

From:

Sent: Mon 4/7/2014 8:04:59 PM

Subject: Re: SPAM-LOW: Re: Quote- |2 Revisedisx.xIsx

thank you!
On Apr 7, 2014, at 3:37 PM, Burke Enterprises, Inc. wrote:

Yes we did rec'd check

From: Burke Enterprises, Inc. (I

Sent: Friday, April 04, 2014 10:44 AM
To: I

Subject: RE: SPAM-LOW: Re: Quote- -2 Revised|sx.xlsx
Will do

rrom: [
Sent: Friday, April 04, 2014 10:31 AM
]

To:
Subject: Fwd: SPAM-LOW: Re: Quote- IR -2 revisedisx.xlsx

Hi...I sent the check on Monday..but perhaps it went out Tues. because I sent from
my NY office...can you please let me know when you do receive it? 1 just checked
with Billy at Prosource and the carpet should be in his warchouse by the end of the

month! Thanks, ||l

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Burke Enterprises, Inc.”
Subject: RE: SPAM-LOW: Re:

=
Revisedlsx.xlsx
Date: April 4, 2014 10:26:49 AM EDT
To: _

Ms. IR good morning

MNo we did not received it but can you let us know when did you mail it out and also Apri

28, 2014 week will be good for us
Thanks for your response and just a note please forward all future email address

Burke Enterprises

Sent: Friday, April 04, :

To: Clint Mohammed
Subject: Re: SPAM-LOW: Re: Quote- |2 Revisedisx.xIsx

EFTA_R1_00728429
EFTA02109310



hello clint... wanted to make sure you received my deposit check...can you
confirm? Also, | think we are looking at installation around April 28th week.
How long do you expect this job to take? (carpet and gyvm)

Thanks, -
On Mar 20, 2014, at 11:00 AM, Clint Mohammed < ||| T

wWrotc:

Thanks
Burke

-—— Original Message -—-

From:

To: Clint Mohammed

Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2014 9:44 AM

Subject: Re: SPAM-LOW: Re: Quote- |2 Revisedisx. xisx

[ will write a check for the deposit and send...not a problem

On Mar 20, 2014, at 9:37 AM., "Clint Mohammed" a_

wrote:

Sorry no we do not take any type of credit cards
Thanks Burke

----- Original Message --—-

From: RS

To: Clint Mohammed

Sent: Wednesday, March 19, 2014 5:34 PM

subject: SPAM-LOW: Re: Quote- |- Revisedisx xisx
Great thanks! Do you take Amex?

Sent from my 1Phone

On Mar 19, 2014, at 1:07 PM, "Clint Mohammed" <{| - ' 1C:
————— Original Message -----
From: _

To:
Sent: Wednesday, March 19, 2014 1:02 PM

Subject: Quote- |2 Revisedisx xisx

EFTA_R1_00728440
EFTA02109311



Ms. - good afternoon please see revised quote attach as per carpet
ordered from Prosource.

As per Billy at Prosource all carpet ordered is Nylon.

Please note a 50% deposit required before job commences and 15 made payable
to Burke Enterprises Inc,

Thanks Stephen Burke for

Burke Enterprises

<(Quote- -2 Revisedlsx. xlsx>

EFTA_R1_00728441
EFTA02109312



