To: Paul Ti

From:

Sent: Tue 4/1/2014 11:46:54 AM
Subject: Re: Online Receipt Confirmation

Sorry | did not reply vesterday! [ will try to give them a call today. | feel good about it though
cause its different. We just have to prey for great weather. Rain would completely suck!

Also, make sure to check your passports that they are valid for our trip in August. They also must
be good for 6 months after the date of travel. | checked ours this moring and we are good!

Sent from my iPhone
On Mar 31, 2014, at 5:21 PM, Paula Garrity _»-mu;:

we just need to pull trigger on Adventure Camp...I get worried that it will suck
and then you will be like “shit, why did I agree to do this?!!!™ Do you want to call
them or do you have any additional questions about 1t?

On Mar 31, 2014, at 5:15 PM,

yae!

On Mar 31, 2014, at 5:10 PM, Paula Garrilg,_ wrote:

Begin forwarded message:

Wrote:

From: Renee2

!ubject: Fwd: !nline Receipt

Confirmation

Date: March 31, 2014 at 10:54:33 AM
EDT

To: Paula Garrity

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:
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From:
recreation(@westportct. gov
Date: March 31, 2014 at 1:53:36 PM EDT
To:
Subject: Online Receipt Conlirmation
Reply-To: recreation@westportct.gov

Internet - Westport Parks and
Recreation
260 Compo Road S

Westport, CT 06880
Phone:

FAX:
Email: recreationfii westporiclL.goy

Please keep a copy of your receipt number for your records.
Your Receipt Number is: 1037940.001

Order Summary:

John Maloney
Enrollment in [ST NFL Expernience - Flag Football (# FF41)
Enrollment Effective Date: March 31, 2014
Mecting Dates: From July 28, 2014 to August 1, 2014
Each Monday from 9am to Noon
Each Tuesday from 9am to Noon
Each Wednesday from 9am to Noon
Each Thursday from 9am to Noon
Each Friday from 9am to Noon

Location: PJ Romano Field - Saugatuck School
170 Riverside Ave.
Westport, CT 06880

The price is $245.00.

Inclement weather will cause the program to cancel for the day
and not be rescheduled.

Your total charge 15 $245.00
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$245.00 was charged to the account of:
Renee Maloney

910 N Phelps Avenue

Winter Park, FL 32789

T

Thank you! Visit us online anytime at:
WwWW WESIpOTree reation,com

http://activenct.active. com/WestportRecreation
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