
To: Lesley Grof mail.com] 
Cc: Rich Kahn( gmail.com) 
From: bellaklein 
Sent: Thur 3/27/2014 7:52:11 PM 
Subject: Re: expenses and medical 

sending a wire now 
On Mar 27, 2014, at 3:43 PM, Lesley Groff c: :> wrote: 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmaitcom>
Date: March 27 2014 3:03:32 PM EDT 
To: ION 
Cc: Lesley Groff <lesley.jee@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: expenses and medical 

Ok 

On Thursday, March 27 2014 
wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 

I hope you are well! I have been unable to reach Richard since I think he is away. 

I need to have an expense wire sent in the amount of $2000 to cover a string of press 
releases. Could you send that? Jeffrey has approved it. 

Also, I'm getting medical insurance and was wondering if Jeffrey has a group plan? If not 
possible, I have a good plan I can join but I need a letter from Enhanced 
Education Inc. stating that I currently work as a consultant and receive 
$2,000 per month. The letter can be attached in an email but it should 
have the foundation's title on it. 

Could you send both items? 

Thank you so much! 
all my best to you, 
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cell: 
email: 

************** ***** **************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to kin, acation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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