To:

From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Tue 3/18/2014 9:26:49 PM
Subject: Re: SLK Invoices...

gareat
received
thanks again

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

On Mar 18. 2014 at 4:37 PZ"-.-’I_- wrote:

done! T didn't even have that many! Only 3.

On Mar 18, 2014, at 3:22 PM, Richard Kahn ~f-'_'-?- wrote:

now would be great
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

On Mar 18, 2014, at 3:09 PZ\-I.__'} wrote:

Hi Rich..I have a reminder to get you the SLK invoices
that I have (from things I have purchased for my house)
Do you want them now? Or wait till April?

Just let me know. lhanks-
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