To:  cintmonamme [
I

From:
Sent: Wed 3/19/2014 9:34:23 PM
Subject: Re: Quote- INNINGEG® Revisedlsx.xlsx

Great thanks! Do you take Amex?

Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 19, 2014, at 1:07 PM, "Clint Mohammed" ~_ wrote:

---—- Original Message -----

From: Clint Mohammed

To:

Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2014 1:02 PM
Subject: Quote- Lesley Groff-2 Revised|sx. xisx

_gomd afternoon please see revised quote attach as per carpet ordered from Prosource,
As per Billy at Prosource all carpet ordered is Nylon.

Please note a 50% deposit required before job commences and 1s made pavable to Burke Enterprises Inc
Ihanks Stephen Burke for

Burke Enterprises

< Qumc- Revisedlsx. xlsx>
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