From: judith donath

Sent: Thur 3/13/2014 2:18:15 PM
Subject: Re: deception

Daonath

Judith

thanks!

on 371372014 10:06 AM, Lesley Groff wrote:

» Judith, our accounting department will cut you a check for the Amtrak
reimbursements. . .where should they send the check to?

-

> On Mar 13, 2014, at 2:53 AM, judith donath wrote:

-

»> Hi

> for my travel - it will come frem the
> Thanks!

R

>

s> on 2/12/2014 8:32 M, |G-
»»» I will get back to you on this as scon a the meantime, you
»»>» could all research flights that would work well for you. ...then I will
»»» either purchase them or have you reimbursed, but we could get the ball
>»> rolling!

1]

v o e |
>>>» 3ent from my iPhone
T
-]
-

EFTA_R1_00733314

EFTA02111674



