From _

Sent: Mon 3M0/2014 1:23:08 PM
Subject: Re: Paris Auto

yes please

thanks

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

On Mar 10, 2014, at 9:13 AM,

Jan 20, 2015
Would you like a copy of DL7

Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 10, 2014, at 9:10 AM, Richard Kahn

do you have jee license and exp date?
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

Date: March 10, 2014
To: Richard Kahn

Hi Rich,

= Wrote:
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In order for AlG International to issue the Paris Auto
Renewal, verification of leffrey's motor vehicle report is
needed. We currently have a USVI number on file however,
they are unable to get a hit.

Can you send me Jeffrey's current license number and
expiration date?

Thank you,

Tracy Penwell

Personal Accounts
Insurance Office of Central Ohio
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delete the file immediately. Thank you
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