
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject 

Lesley Groff 
Fri 3/14 5:42:01 PM 
Re: 

I happened to be on Amex...I have put this flight on HOLD for her—as soon as I get 
the ticket will forward to you and JE— it is $483.10 non refundable. 

On Mar 7, 2014, at 12:33 PM, > wrote: 

> Hi Les, 

> • Would you check please if this flight is available for at a similar 
price with Amex? I can't change the reservation without a huge penalty - easier 
to get a new cheap flight. jE wants march 12 now from New York 

> <photo.JPG> 

> Sent from my iPhone 
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