
Bella Klein 

From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Wed 3/5/2014 4:44:46 PM 
Subject Fwd: 

M, can you please advise what needs to be purchased through the foundation? Is this a flight? 
Rich, do you have a cc for "the foundation" so can purchase this flight if it is indeed a flight? 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <ieevacation@gmail.com>
Date: March 5, 2014 11:24:11 AM EST 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Fwd: 

should be paid from foundation. 

 Forwarded messa e 
From: 
Date: Wed, Mar 5, 2014 at 12:23 PM 
Subject: 
To: Jeffrey <jecvaeation@gmail.com>

The discount wcbsite came up with a great deal - 3500 direct round trip! 

Sent from my iPhone 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jgcvacation@ ginail coin, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
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