
To: Richard Kahntrichardkahn12@gmail.com) 
From: 
Sent Wed 2/19/2014 9:44:37 PM 
Subject Re: Invoices from Joe Thakurial 

oh my....so after all that...JE doesn't want to do it! I will leave it be...ifJeffrey wants me to say 
something he will tell me. My bet, he will just wait to hear back from Joe! although that is a 
crazy number! 
On Feb 19, 2014, at 4:39 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

i brough up 324,000 annual cost from joseph and he laughed and said no way.. 
not sure if you should seek direction from jee to communicate back to joseph or 
wait for joseph to reach out.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fa 
ce 

On Feb 10, 2014, at 12:56 PM, wrote: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Joseph Thakuria 

UtRM.... woice or Je rey? 
Date: Februa 10. 2014 12:51:57 PM EST 
To: 

Hi 
Sorry for the delay. I was busy catching up on clinical work and 

snowboarding all last week with friends in Breckenridge. 

Please pass on the attached invoice to Jeffrey. There are quite a few 
attachments so I would instruct him to start with the 
invoice which will make reference to other attachments 
(and put them in proper context). 

I provided a lot of info (erring on the side of providing more explanation 
rather than too little). 
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Jeffrey should feel free to contact me anytime withquestions regarding the 
invoice by email or cell phone 

Thanks! 
Joe 

On Mon, Feb 10, 2014 at 7:58 AM, 
wrote: 

Hello joe Hope you had a nice weekend. Might you be 
able to give me an update on the invoice Jeffrey would 
like from you? 

Thanks, 

Sent from my iPhonc 
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