
To: Lesley 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Thur 2/20/2014 9:52:27 PM 
Subject: Re: Check from Terje 

thank you 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

On Feb 20, 2014, at 4:45 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

HI Rich...I have a check here from Terje to Jeffrey ($130,000 for "replacement of 
loan") ...I will keep it here in my desk drawer for you to pick up tomorrow... 
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