
To: Richard Kahn 
From: 
Sent Mon 2/10/2014 2:32:13 PM 
Subject Re: Ballet fund? 

ok, thanks...I have in my reminders and will ask him again at some point 

On Feb 10, 2014, at 8:36 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

> He did not respond to my email 

> • On 2/10/14 7:51 AM, wrote: 

» Did JE get back to you re how he wants to pay for the ballet fund this 
» year? 

>> Sent from my iPhone 
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