
To: Joseph Thakuri 
From: 
Sent Mon 2/10/2014 5:56:02 PM 
Subject Re: Invoice for Jeffrey? 

FANTASTIC!!! 
Thank you s0000 very much. Hope you had a great time snow boarding!! 
I will pass this along to Jeffrey and Pm sure he will be in touch. 

On Feb 10, 2014, at 12:51 PM, Joseph Thakuria wrote: 

Hi MI, 
Sorry for the delay. I was busy catching up on clinical work and snowboarding all 
last week with friends in Breckenridge. 

Please pass on the attached invoice to Jeffrey. There are quite a few attachments so I 
would instruct him to start with the invoice which will make reference to other 
attachments (and put them in proper context). 

I provided a lot of info (erring on the side of providing more explanation rather than too 
little). 

Jeffrey should feel free to contact me anytime with questions regarding the invoice by 
email or cell phone 

Thanks! 
Joe 

On Mon, Feb 10, 2014 at 7:58 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

Hello joe Hope you had a nice weekend. Might you be able to give me an update 
on the invoice Jeffrey would like from you? 

Thanks, 

Sent from my iPhone 

<JE_invoice_final.docx><JVT_NIH_biosketch_01_15_14.doc><Caskey_pnas201 
3_houston_ypo.pdf><ACMG_Incidental_Findings_recs_6_20_13.pdf><Legacy.pd 
f><WGS_in_NICU_patients_Sci Transl Med-2012-Saunders.pdf> 
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