
To: Lesley 
Groft 

From: bellaklein 
Sent: Wed 12/18/2013 12:58:48 PM 
Subject: Re: Dr Qureshi/dr ting 

Great, 

Thank you, 

Bella 

On Dec 18, 2013, at 7:43 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

> JE saw dr Qureshi (a back doctor) yesterday. They will send invoice to 
insurance and bill if necessary 

> Jeffrey saw Dr Ting yesterday (plastic surgeon) and had a cyst removed. He also 
has JE's insurance on file 

> Sue and Jen attended both appts with him. If you have any questions please ask 
them. Thx 

> Sent from my iPhone 
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