To:
Cc: Bella HleinlbklemSTEﬁlimail .::::rml; h grof | o

From: Richard Kahn
Sent: Mon 12/8/2013 7:33:22 PM
Subject: Fwd: Can you confirm the following Amazon charges on JE Amex? Txs

did you get any resolution from jee if these purchases were legitimate?
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

tel

Begin forwarded message:

From: bellaklein <G
Subject: Fwd: Can you confirm the following Amazon charges on JE
Amex? Txs

Date: December 4, 2013 4:39:09 PM EST
To: Richard Kahn GG

Rich,

Can you ask the new Apple guy if he ordered speakers, headphones.. Or if you can help
with contact info.

[Xs

Begin forwarded message:

From: Lesley Groff { | RN

Subject: Re: Can you confirm the following Amazon
charges on JE Amex? Txs
Date: December 4, 2013 4:31:34 PM EST

maybe

On Dec 4, 2013, at 4:27 PM, bellaklein wrote:

maybe JE purchased it for the 6th floor. ..

On Dec 4, 2013, at 4:20 PM, Lesley (_'-roﬁ"'-_ wrote:

EFTA_R1_00752261
EFTA02119573



rich b. didnt' order it...l see one of the boxes
here and there 1s no packing ship. 1t 1s
flashlights and headphones...probably for
island...sue do you know?

On Dec 4, 2013, at 4:16 PM, bellaklein
wrote:

thank you Les, may be Rich
purchased things or JE. Who
unpack the boxes, there should
be some paperwork.

On Dec 4, 2013, at 4:12 PM,

Lesley Groff
- o

we have rec'd 2
boxes (one
yesterday and one
today) from
Amazon to JE... |
did not purchase
them. but they are
headphones and
speaker stuff' I think

On Dec 4, 2013, at 4:09 PM, bellaklein wrote:
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