From: osep akuria

Sent: Fri 12/6/2013 9:51:39 PM
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein/invaice

Hi .
[ just need to finalize and price the best software tool to use for some individualized custom
genome analysis | have planned. I've got it down to 2-3 potential vendors now.

I should have the final invoice for you and Jeffrey by end of the day Monday (after I'm done
seeing patients). Apologies for the delay and have a nice weekend.

Joe

On Fri. Dec 6, 2013 at 3:45 PwL_: wrote:

Hi Joe. Jeffrey 1s asking for you mvoice. Have you been able to get together for him?

He 1s anxious to receive!

Thanks, -

Sent from my iPhone
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