
To: 
From: Cheryl Amodeo 
Sent: Tue 12/3/2013 11:27:27 PM 
Subject: RE: California Closets 

One quick question — what hardware do you want for Drawers? 

From: 
Sent: ues
To: Cheryl Amodeo 
Subject: Re: California Closets 

Yes!! Perfect. If I don't answer leave a msg. I work in my bosses house and I 
could be busy or it may be bad reception. But I will call you back! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 3, 2013, at 5:20 PM, Cheryl Amodeo IM => wrote: 
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Great because I'd like to get you on the install schedule asap and will bring 
payment and contracts to Costco! Call you tomorrow for the Amex# 

Have a good night :-) 

From: 
Sent: Tuesday, December 3, 2013 4:59 PM 
To: Cheryl Amodeo 
Subject: Re: California Closets 

great..I 'II give you my Amex...I will do ASAP 

On Dec 3, 2013, at 4:57 PM, Cheryl Amodeo wrote: 

OK — there are 2 contracts that I will fill out. One is California Closets and one is Costco. Since you had 
called through Costco, everything including payment is processed through them. Their payment terms 
are pay in full and then you will receive the $900 cash card. They accept AMEX or a check made out to 
Costco. 

As soon as we have all of this, I can get this scheduled for you!! 

From: 
Sent: Tuesday, December 03, 201 4:54 PM 
To: Cheryl Amodeo 
Subject: Re: California Closets 

Terrific! I won't be home on Thursday but you could leave with (just let me 
know about what time cause she will be in and out)...I will be working from home on Friday and 
can sign and send off with deposit! 3 weeks should be just fine!! I would love if it could be 
before the holidays (my family is coming up for new years eve) ...but you let me know... 
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On Dec 3, 2013, at 4:48 PM, Cheryl Amodco wrote: 

Thanks 

I'm in New Canaan on Thursday afternoon and can stop by with the contract. We're booked out 
about 3 weeks for installation. When do you want this installed? Before or after the holidays 

From: 
Sent: Tuesday, December 3, 2013 4:43 PM 
To: Cheryl Amodeo 
Subject: Re: California Closets 

yes! 

Lets do it!! Where is the dotted line and how much deposit do you need? What is production 
time? woo hoo! 

On Dcc 3, 2013, at 4:29 PM, Cheryl Amodco wrote: 

KM -

Like this? It's $898 ($823 with Costco) 

<image001.prig> 

From: 
Sent: Tuesday, December 03, 2013 4:24 PM 
To: Cheryl Amodeo 
Subject: Re: California Closets 

Ok, can you change the closet with all the shelves to shelves on the bottom (like 3 rows) then a 
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hanging bar above?...what is price tag for that... 

On Dec 3, 2013, at 4:14 PM, Cheryl Amodeo wrote: 

Haha. You got it! Here is■c!oset designs --

<irnage001.jpg> <image002.jpg> 

EFTA_R1_00752897 
EFTA02119974


