
To: Lesley Grof
From: bellaklein 
Sent Mon 33 PM 
Subject: Re: Dentist and Fekkai cut 

ok, please confirm, 
Thank you 
On Dec 2, 2013, at 4:13 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

> no, I am holding appt w/visa...but I must call day of to pay...i was going to 
put on visa...i think that is what they have on file.. 

> On Dec 2, 2013, at 4:08 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

» did you use JE AMEX for Patric? 
>> On Dec 2, 2013, at 2:57 PM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

>» will have her hair cut with Patrick at Fekkai on Wed. Dec. 4th 
at 6pm... will have her teeth cleaned at Dr. Magnani's on Thurs. Dec. 5th at 
5pm. IIII is handling the manicure and white strips.... 
>>> 
>» 
>> 
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