From:
Sent: Mon 11/25/2013 12:57:05 PM
Subject: Re: Invoice #WP035589

Hi Eatie. Could voy check on the ETA of my fabric please? Let me know what you
find out! Thanks,

rom my iPhone

On Nowv 17, 2013, at 11:20 AM, "Painter's Supply"” _ Wrote:

> EE;- Attached please find a copy of wour inveoice. Last c
fabric 15 still on schedule for the end of November. Thanks for vou
35589, PDF>

» <InvoliceWpo
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