
To: 
From: 
Sent: Tue 11/12/2013 7:23:26 PM 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

ok, super. thanks 
On Nov 12, 2013, at 2:22 PM, Lyndsi Turner 

Hi 

I am actually not quite sure. 
I can call the Gotham Committee office and inquire. 

Thank you 

All the best, 
Lyndsi 

Lyndsi Turner 
Assistant to Peggy Siegal 
Peggy Siegal Company 
750 Lexington Avenue 
5th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

From: 
Sent: Tuesday, ovem er , : 
To: Lyndsi Turner 
Subject: Jeffrey Epstein 

wrote: 

Hi Lyndsi...Jeffrey now wishes to donate S10,000 to the Gotham Awards...Rich in 
our accounting dept is asking if we are to write the check to IFP and send to same 
address...can you confirm? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Gotham 
Date: November 12, 2013 12:59:16 PM EST 
To: 
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Attached is what we sent in previous years 
Can you please confirm same for this year contribution of 10,000 by Enhanced 
Education 
Thank you 

You can make the check out to Independent Filmmaker Project (IFP). 

You can send the check to: 
IFP 
c/o Mitchell Micich 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 
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