
To: Sue Caffrey 
Cc: Bob Caffre 
From: 
Sent Wed 11/13/2013 3:27:02 PM 
Subject: Re: Request... 

Hi Sued show we have paid Bob S104,500.00 to date-can you update on your 
spreadsheet? 

...this is very helpful and we greatly appreciate the time you put in to doing 
this for us. thanks, 

on Nov 12, 2013, at 8:59 PM, Sue Caffrey wrote: 

> <Original Estimate to Actual 11-6-13 with final cost estimates.xlsx> 
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