
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, June 26, 2017 9:39 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: GIV camera 

yes 

On Mon, Jun 26, 2017 at 4:32 PM, Larry Visoski =gt; wrote: 

Jeffrey 
An Exchange Gavis Inferred Camera for GIV just came available, cost $26,000=( I am dealing direct with Gavis 

Camera). 
- A Previous camera repair cost was $41,000 to another GIV last year Thru G=lfsream,. This is a good price at 

$26k 
May I have your approval to purchase and have Fedex to Palm Bch for install=on Wednesday? 

Is this approved? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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