From: Gary kerney <

Sent: Friday, November 25, 2011 2:56 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Ce: I
Subject: Fw: LS)

Attachments: LS) Change Order tile (#11).doc; ATT10481488 htm

=BODY bgColor=§ffffff> =DIV dir=Itr id=idOWAReplyText27729= =DIV dir=ltr>The =ttachment change order outlines the
proposal for tiling of the main =ool, =0DIV dir=ltr> =DIV dir=ltr=Brice has had contact with =art on the replaster of the
flagpole.Bart is prepared to replaster at =is expence as soon as a schedule can be agreed upon and =hen recieve his final
payment after its done,

=DIV dir=ltr>

=DIV dir=Itr>Brice should bring you up on =is comunications with Bart.

=DIV dir=Itr=I think there are still =uestions on the unglased tile for the main pool and schedule =ssues.

=DIV dir=Itr>

=DIV dir=ltr>

=DIV dir=Itr>

=DIV dir=Itr>

=DIV dir=ltr>

=HR tablndex=-1> =FONT size=2 face=Tahoma=From: Gary Kerney

Sent: =ed 11/2/2011 3:50 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein; Brice Gorden; =arren Indyke

Subject: Fwd: LSJ

=DIV> =DIV=

If you go forward we should execute our contract and attach the =roposal to it.

=DIV>Brice , | would review with bart on the exact specifications of the =aterials and sources and timing for delivery and
installation =DIV=>

=DIV=

Sent from my iPhone
=DIV=>

Begin forwarded message:

=BLOCKQUOTE type="cite"> =DIV>From: Wendy Lockman <wendylockman@yahoo.com>

=B=Date: November 2, 2011 2:03:26 PM EDT

To: [ - I, -

Subject: LSJ

Reply-To: Wendy Lockman =lt:wendylockman@yahoo.com> =BR> =DIV> =BLOCKQUOTE type="cite"> =DIV> =DIV
style="BACKGROUND-COLOR: #fff; FONT-FAMILY: times new roman, new =ork, times, serif; COLOR: #000; FONT-SIZE:
12pt"= =DIV=Gary, =DIV=>

=DIV=Attached you will find the material list and change order number =1. We have a balance on the flag pool of
$34,742.19. Hard =ost for us to replaster the pool is approximately 514,000.00 - =15,000.00. All the labor to redo the
plaster is given. All =f the guys were paid their daily wage so they will re-trowel for =othing. We have to pay for the new
Diamond Brite only. We =ill also have to chip out the existing Diamond Brite. There is no =rofit or overhead with this
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cost as it is a hard cost. This is =hat it will cost me to come in and replaster the pool. | would =ike to see at least 5

20,000.00 of my balance wired over to me please. =nbsp;Let me know if you have any further questions.
=DIV=

=DIV=Thank you,
=DIV=>

=DIV=Bart Wolterman
=BLOCKQUOTE type="cite"> =DIV=>
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