
From: 
To: 
Cc 

Subject: RE: sorry to bother you 
Date: hi, 08 Oct 2021 20:46:40 40000 

Embedded: RELE-TICKET_RECEITI? -_Travel_Datc:_26AUG19_-_FteE_XHICCBU_.mss 

Sorry, i can't find anyone under that name. is It possible you used your card to pay for this? 

Below are the only names we charged for 

9/10/2018 9/14/2018 Hotel NYC 50Bowery Confirmation,/ 11253119 
12/2/2018 12/4/2018 The Frederick/Cosmopolitan Hotel - W. YU Confirmation# 3053471 
12/10/2018 12/12/2018 The Frederick/Cosmopolitan Hotel - W. YU Confirmation!, 3053887 
12/2/2019 12/4/2019 The Frederick/Cosmopolitan Hotel - W. YU Confirmation!, 3053471 
12/9/2018 12/11/2018 The Frederick/Cosmopolitan Hotel - W. YU Confirmation!, 3058807 
2/13/2019 2/15/2019 Hotel NYC 50 Bowery - Cancelled Confirmationa 99156854 

9/10/2018 9/14/2018 Hotel NYC 50 Bowery Confirmation,/ 11253119 
12/2/2018 12/4/2018 The Frederick/Cosmopolitan Hotel - W. YU Confirmation!, 3053471 
12/10/2018 12/12/2018 The Frederick/Cosmopolitan Hotel - W. YU Confirmation!, 3053887 
12/2/2019 12/4/2019 The Frederick/Cosmopolitan Hotel - W. YU Confirmation,/ 3053471 
12/9/2018 12/11/2018 The Frederick/Cosmopolitan Hotel - W. YU Confirmation,/ 3058807 
2/13/2019 2/15/2019 Hotel NYC 50 Bowery - Cancelled Confirmation,/ 99156854 

From: 
Sent: Friday, October 8, 2021 431 PM 
To: aiNNie 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: sorry to bother you 

Thanks for checking, The flights were in August and/or September. 

On Oct 8, 2011, at 4:18 PM, wrote: 

Could we have reimbursed someone for the flight here in September 2019. Her name 

She thinks she was reimbursed by the office. 

Victim Witness Coordinator 

United States Attorney's Office 

Southern District of New York 

New York, New York 10007 
Tel. 

EFTA00077893


