
From: ' 

To: ' 

Cc: '  

Subject: FW: 

(NY) (FBI)" <I 

  (VSD) (FBI)" <I 

(NY) (FBI)"

Esptein Victim Seeking Reimbursement for Treatment 

Date: Tue, 24 Nov 2020 18:50:43 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Attachments: 2020-09-02 Kavanagh_invoice_paid.pdf; 

'Mine-Images: image001.png 

— here is it. So weird it doesn't forward when using the Samsung. 

From: Maria Kelljchian < 
Sent: Tuesday, November 24, 2020 10:49 AM 
To: (NY) (FBI) 
Cc: Brittany Henderson < >; Maria Cardenal .c: > Brad Edwards < 
Subject: (EXTERNAL EMAIL] - Esptein Victim Seeking Reimbursement for Treatment 

Good morning . I hope this email finds you well. I wanted to ask if we would be able to seek 
reimbursement/payment for treatment received by victim . She is a Florida Epstein victim who does not 
have health insurance and has paid for her treatment on her own. Below is the name of the Counseling Center and the 
visits. 

Oakbrook Counseling Center 
Therapist Shelley Kavanagh, LCSW 
4804 W. Commercial Blvd. 
Tamarac, FL 33319 

but I do not have that invoice. 

I have attached two invoices here. The first invoice for $900.00 has been paid in full and the second invoice remains 
outstanding. 

I believe that you have already interviewed the victim. Please let me know what else would need to be done to get this 
approved and paid. 

Hope you have a wonderful Thanksgiving. 

Thank you! 
Maria K. 
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EDWARDS 
POTTING ER LLC 

Maria W. Kelljchian 
Florida Registered Paralegal 
425 North Andrews Avenue. Suite 2 
Fort Lauderdale. Florida 33301 

I www.epllc.com 
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