From: " I . (NY) (1) <
To: " o) 1) <. T, I . (VSD) (FBI)’

-

Subject: Fwd: [EXTERNAL EM;"'LIL] - Epicin Victim Seeking Reimbursement for
Treatment
Date: Tue, 24 Nov 2020 18:32:23 +0000
Importance: Mormal
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Yes she was. She's met with us in the past.

On Nov 24, 2020 1:19 PM, " N (V) (FBD)" < - 1ot

B bclow is the email I told you about earlier. I told them I wasn't sure since approval was needed prior to
treatment. What else do you need?

- - she was at the meeting November 12th right?

-~ Forwarded message ————-——-

From: Maria Kelljchian *i_-“-*
Date: Nov 24, 2020 10:49 AM
Subject: [EXTERNAL EMAIL] -

To: " (NY) (FBD" <

Ce: Brittany Henderson <

Esptein Victim Seeking Reimbursement for Treatment

Cardenal < s

=g

Good morning i} ' hope this email finds you well. | wanted to ask if we would be able to seek
reimbursement/payment for treatment received by victim ||| 3l She is a Florida Epstein victim who does not
have health insurance and has paid for her treatment on her own. Below is the name of the Counseling Center and the

VIsits,

Oakbrook Counseling Center
Therapist Shelley Kavanagh, LCSW
4804 W. Commercial Blvd.
Tamarac, FL 33319

oakbrookcounselingcenter@gmail.com

Dates of service:

I |, but | do not have that invoice.
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| have attached two invoices here. The first invoice for $900.00 has been paid in full and the second invoice remains
outstanding.

| believe that you have already interviewed the victim. Please let me know what else would need to be done to get this
approved and paid.

Hope you have a wonderful Thanksgiving.

Thank you!
Maria K.
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Maria W. Kelljchian

Florida Registered Paralegal
425 Morth Andrews Avenue, Suite 2
Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33301

- | www.epllc.com
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