
From: 'a> 
To:'

Subject: Fwd: (no subject) 

Date: Tue, 17 Dec 2019 01:03:47 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

 Forwarded messa e 
From: " 
Date: Dec 16, 2019 7:42 AM 
Subject: no sub'ect 
To: ' 
Cc: ' 
I should point this out: 

was seeing a therapist since the day we met. 
As recently as the Epstein briefing, when we spoke, she said she was still seeing that same therapist and really 
liked her. 
In that same day she gave a form for what she says is "free therapy for life." It wasn't the CVC form 
(we already figured out it wasn't the CVC form and don't know which form she is referring to). 
I am curious if the therapist is providing to us is the same one she has been seeing this whole time. Not 
that it matters for EVAF, I suppose, yet the timing is interesting. 

On Dec 16, 2019 7:09 AM, "= IMIE> wrote: 
Hi - I got the info: 

independently made an appointment for tonight at 7pm. 

This therapist is: 

Her rate is 150 for the first session which is an hour and a half. Then 90 thereafter for an hour. 

asked FBI to call her and explain how she will get paid. 

Side note: I'm still waiting for her CVC application. This information is being provided so EVAF funds may be 
pursued. 

Thank you so much, 

On Dec lo, 2019 9:16 PM, wrote:

EFTA00153486



Can u get me the cost and send to me? I will request an EVAF to 
And the therapist info be we will need to talk to them about billing. 

Thanks 

On Dec 10, 2019 9:14 pm, "a wrote: 
Yes, she said she wants counseling asap and she has identified a therapist she wants. 

On Dec 10, 2019 7:53 pm, "a wrote: 
if she needs counseling before please let me know. We can ask for EVAF or refer her. 

On Dec lo, 2019 7:38 pm, 'a wrote: 
I'll send her an email copy to see if she recognized the application. 
If not, have her re do it and email it to me. 
After that, I'll give to you, to give your OVS POC. 

On Dec 10, 2019 5:37 PM, ' wrote: 
If it was a CV C application, I would have handed it to So it may have been submitted correctly in the 
1st place. Who knows... 

FBI 
Seattle Division 
Bellin ram Resident Agency 

On Dec lo, 2019 2:35 pm, a wrote: 
if you could assist her that would be great. If we need to get her to complete another form maybe she can 

complete and email to you. 

On Dec 10, 2019 5:08 Ilifir= IMIE> wrote: 
I've been working with since her initial interview. 
At the time I spoke w her at the victim conference she wasn't going to submit CVC paperwork. 
Today she told me she handed the form to and she doesn't have a copy to show me. 
I agree one VS is always best yet here we are. :) 

On Dec 10, 2019 5:05 pm, a wrote: 
Can you find out how she submitted it? Also lets emphasize the importance of her talking to one vs only so 
things are streamlined. 

On Dec lo, 2019 5:03 pm, "a wrote: 

EFTA00153487



called OVS and they said they have no record of her application. 

On Dec lo, 2019 5:02 PM, wrote: 
I do not believe that she has received a claim number but I will verify that. 

FBI 
Seattle Division 
Bellin ham Resident Agency 

On Dec lo, 2019 2:01 Pm, "a wrote: 
Has she received a claim number? I will. All them tomorrow to see if they received it. 

On Dec lo, 2019 4:59 PM, wrote: 
It has to be written. 

, perhaps you can help expedite this? 

On Dec lo, 2019 4:58 PM, wrote: 
Ah, I see. I will reach out to her and ask for permission. Can she give verbal consent or must it be written? 

FBI 
Seattle Division 
Bellin yam Resident Agency 

On Dec 10, 2019 1:56 PM, "a> wrote: 
There isn't anything I can do on end because she didn't give me permission to speak with OVS. 
I entrust this part to you and 

On Dec lo, 2019 4:55 PM, wrote: 
Thank you all for jumping in on this. I spoke with Jen yesterday and was going to follow up with you guys. 

Has she been calling aike else? If not, I am happy to get back with her to clarify things. (If this is the case I 
will wait to hear from 

Thoughts? 

FBI 
Seattle Division 
Bellin ham Resident Agency 

On Dec 10, 2019 1:03 PM, wrote: 

EFTA00153488



I just found out today that she submitted one. 

On Dec 10, 2019 3:56 PM, wrote: 
Hi Ladies - I am confsed who submitted her application? All applications were to be submitted by me as 
instructed by at the meeting. That was in hopes to prevent this issue. There is one ovs case manager 
assigned to the case. 

Please let me know so we can get her claim approved. 

Thanks 

On Decec 10 2019 3:44 PM, 'a. wrote: 
Hi , is seeking confirmation that NY CVC received her application. 
Can  please check on the status? 

didn't sign off on the form to allow me permission to speak with them. She really wants therapy and so 
far NY CVC told her they don't have the application. 

Thank you, 

EFTA00153489


