
Message 

From: Waldron, Chelsey Devon 
Sent: 7/30/2014 8:29:42 PM 
To: 
CC: Shkreli, Juliana I; Waldron, Chelsey Devon 
Subject: RE: Trans request 

As discussed, the below transfer is complete. 

Thank you, 
Chelsey 

From: Waldron, Chelsey Devon 
Sent: Wednesday, July 30, 2014 1:17 PM 
To: 
Cc: Shkreli, Juliana; Ramdeen, Vijai; Waldron, Chelsey Devon 
Subject: RE: Trans request 

Hi =, 

As discussed, we submitted the below transfer. We will confirm once complete. 

Thank you, 
Chelsey 

From: 
Sent: Wednesday, July 30, 2014 12:54 PM 
To: Ramdeen, Vijai 
Cc: Waldron, Chelsey Devon; Shkreli, Juliana 
Subject: Trans request 

Good afternoon, 
We would like to make an internal transfer of $110,000 from GM savings to the 116 account. 
Many thanks, 

Date: Wednesday, July 30, 2014 at 12:48 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: <no subject> 

Ok 
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From: 
Sent: Wednesday, 30 July 2014 12:48 
To: G Maxwell 
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C. thick!** e nn ci ihiarts 

We will need to trans $110k UM in order to cover the following checks: 
$64k Tony, 
$25k Dynaire, 
$7k United Tower, and 
514k Dynaire Annual 
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