Message

From: Shkreli, Julian
Sent: 9/8/2016 2:46:13 PM

To: I | R

cc: Ramdeen, Vijai | [
Subject: RE: MAXWELL: internal Trans request
]

The transfer is complete.

Thanks,
Juliana

From: Shkreli, Juliana

Sent: Thursday, September 08, 2016 10:37 AM
To:

Cc: Ramdeen, Vijai; Shkreli, Juliana

Subject: MAXWELL: internal Trans request

Hi
We entered the transfer and will confirm once complete.

Thanks,
Juliana

From: I
Sent: Thursday, September 08, 2016 10:15 AM
To: Shkreli, Juliana; Ramdeen, Vijai; Ladd, Molly
Subject: internal Trans request

Good morning,

Can we please make an internal transfer in the amount of 52,828 from GM checking “Jill§ to Max Hotel "Jil§?

Thank you,
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