Message

From: Rivas, Elyanna [N |

Sent: 8/8/2018 1:06:31 PM

To: 'G Max' [

cc: Shkreli, Juliana (NG Fomdeen. Viiai [[INNEGEEEEEEEE . /= er. Christopher
(I

Subject: TERRAMAR: Wire Depaosit

Good morning Ghislaine,
confirming we do not see a $20,000 deposit in the TerraMar account.

Thank you!
Ely

Elyanna Rivas
Client Service Associate

UEs Financial Services Inc.

Private wealth Management

1285 Awvenue of the americas, 38th Floor
Mew York, NY 10019

phone: NS 2 I
|

-----original Message-----

From: G Max [mailto:

Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 2018 7:36 AM
To: Rivas, Elyanna

Subject:

Morning Elly. Can you check if the 20k hit the TerraMar account yet?
Thank wyou

CONFIDENTIAL UBSTERRAMAROODO37E0
EFTA00239121



