From: Lesley Grofl

To: "Philipps Bar”
Subject: RE: Jeffray Epstain
Date: Thursday, February 24, 2011 1:31:38 PM

Ok very good...I did have Bella research back and she also came to the conclusion $150...50 | think
you are right we go with $150! I'm sure Jeffrey will send you lots of business!! | have made an
appt for a girl to come see you next Tues in fact!

From: Philippe Barr [mailto:

Sent: Thursday, February 24, 2011 1:22 PM
To: Lesley Groff

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein

Yes sorry.can't remember what 1 charge b4 because I remember Patrick I think was charging
5200. So I believe it was $175. But tues night I said to Jeffery 5150. S0 we should do $150.
Do you have a record from the last time?

Philippe B

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 24, 2011, at 11:32, Lesley Groff < ||| || GGG—_> o

Hi Philippe...just following up...can you let me know the price you and Jeffrey
decided on for cuts? 1 just want us all on the same page (you, our accounting
dept. and JE's assistants).

Thank you!

Lesley

EFTA00296145



