
From: 

To: Lesley Groff <1 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Date: Thu, 11 Aug 2016 15:25:05 +0000 

Great!see u soon Lesley!have a good weekend!ilaq, 

> On 11 Aug 2016, at 21:53, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 

> Ok super! Yes I'm sure it will be the same dentist. Sounds good. Thx and see you in Oct. 

> Sent from my iPhone 

>> On Aug 11, 2016, at 9:40 AM, < > wrote: 
>> 
>> I'm coming back to ny in oct with the same dentist i think 
>> 
>>> On 11 Aug 2016, at 20:35, Lesley Groff > wrote: 
>>> 
>>> Are you coming back here to NY in Oct. for Invisiline or will you do it in China? 
>>> 
>>>> On Aug 10, 2016, at 11:59 PM, .‘z > wrote: 
>>>> 
>>>> And Lesley,Jeffrey said he can help me do the Invisalign,so the doctor set me an 
appointment on October, we will start doing the treatment. i asked them normally it cost 8000 
dollars, you may don't know about it? 
>>>> 
>>>>> On 11 Aug 2016, at 08:32, Lesley Groff > wrote: 
>>>>> 

>>>>> •E that would be great. Thanks 
>>>>> 
>>>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>>>> 
>>>>>> On Aug 10, 2016, at 7:22 PM, wrote: 
>>>>>> 
>>>>>> Oh i see! I can make you sure that he already knew about this crown appointment!i 
should let you know it after the first appointment...sorry about it... 
>>>>>> Lets keep in touch,best to you. 
>>>>>> 
>>>>>> 
>>>>>> 
>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> On 11 Aug 2016, at 07:02, Lesley Groff < wrote: 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> Nothing is wrong! The accounting dept was asking me about it and I was unaware of 
the crown appointment . Just wanted to ask you first (instead of bothering Jeffrey with it-
the accounting dept always makes me accountable for the bills) All is good ! Take care. 
Lesley 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>>> On Aug 10, 2016, at 6:49 PM, < > wrote: 
>>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>» Hey Lesley!I'm good thanks!yes 

..of course i speak to Jeffrey he knew it .is 
there something wrong? 
>>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>>>> On 11 Aug 2016, at 02:17, Lesley Groff < 
>>>>>>>>> 
>>>>>>>» Hi ..Hope 

> wrote: 

your trip home went well and all is good...quick question...when you were 
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here and saw 
Jeffrey about it? 
> > > > > > > > > 
>>>>>>>» Thanks, Lesley 
>>> 

..did you go back a second time for work to be done? did you speak to 
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