From: bellaklein <[ -
To: [
Subject: Re: Lotus Invoice# 19666
Date: Tue, 09 Aug 2016 18:25:52 +0000

correct. i got [ ok
Thank vou,
Bella

Tel:

On Aug 9, 2016, at 1:04 PM, — wrote:

this looks like it was for Karyna not [Jji§...7

On Aug 8, 2016, at 4:38 PM., bellaklein f—'-'-* wrote:
Hi Il

Please confirm that the attached invoice 15 correct
Thank vou,
Bella

Tel:

Begin forwarded message:

From: dispatcher@LotusRide.com
Subject: Lotus Invoice# 19666

Date: August 8, 2016 at 4:02:01 PM EDT
To: ap@hbrkassociates.com

<Invoice # 19666.pdf=
<AndroidVoucher.zip=

<WVoucher (inv # 19666).pdf>

EFTA00321157



