
From: ifly Heliflite Scheduling & Dispatch

To: "Giacomo, Jenna" <:I I=I=>, Richard Kahn 

Cc: ifl Heliflite Scheduling & Dispatch 
, Larry Visoski

Subject: RE: Cost of trip 

Date: Tue, 26 Jul 2016 21:05:29 +0000 

Attachments: _heliflitepaxsched.pdf 

Richard, 

The updated trip sheet is attached now reflecting a 5:00 PM return to East 34th. For 
billing, Mr. Farkas' office has informed us to bill them as we usually would for his flights. 

Brad Greiner 
Manager of Scheduling, Dispatch and Charter 
office 888.802.9822 I fax 862.902.1566 

About HeliFlite: 
. 9 Executive Cabin Class Helicopters 
. Twin Engine 
. Dual Piloted 
. Wyvern Recommended 
. ARG/US Platinum Rated 
Based at EWR and 43IL (Downtown Chicago) 

 Original Message 
From: Giacomo, Jenna [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, July 26, 2016 4:38 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: ifly Heliflite Scheduling S Dispatch; Lesley Groff; Larry Visoski 
Subject: RE: Cost of trip 

It went to everyone. 
I do not have this information. 
Can someone at heliflight please advise? 

Thank you. 

 Original Message 
From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, July 26, 2016 4:37 PM 
To: Giacomo, Jenna 
Subject: Cost of trip 

Not sure my last email should have gone to everyone or just you. Please advise on cost of 
proposed trip for tomorrow. Thank you 

Rich 

Sent from my iPhone 

This message, and any attachments hereto, is confidential and intended exclusively for the 
use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. This communication may contain 
information that is confidential, proprietary, privileged, subject to a confidentiality 
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and/or non-disclosure agreement, or otherwise exempt or protected from disclosure (either by 
contract or under applicable law). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby 
notified that printing, retaining, reproducing, copying, disclosing, disseminating or using 
this message or any information contained herein (including any reliance thereon) is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please contact the sender immediately 
and destroy the message (including any attachments) and any copies in their entirety, whether 
in electronic or hard copy format. Nothing contained in this e-mail shall be considered a 
legally binding agreement, amendment or modification of any agreement with Island Capital 
Group LLC or any of its affiliates, each of which requires a fully executed agreement to be 
received by Island Capital Group LLC or such affiliate. 
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