
From: Lesley Groff <MIMIII > 

To: '1 1.
Subject: Re: Estimate 0000206 from NR CONTRACTING LLC 

Date: Tue, 05 Apr 2016 15:52:21 +0000 

Hi Norman...thank you for your quote and time! but we are going with with someone else this 
time! Hope all is well. Lesley 

> On Apr 2, 2016, at 10:40 AM, NR CONTRACTING LLC wrote: 

> • You have received an estimate from NR CONTRACTING LLC for $2,050.00. To view, print or 
download a PDF copy of your estimate, click the link below: 

> http://www.aynax.com/rar5-sba4-dg0v.est 

> • Best regards, 
> NR CONTRACTING LLC ( 
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