
From: 
To: 

Subject: Fwd: From Ehud and Nili in 11J - bill attached 
Date: Fri, 05 Feb 2016 19:45:51 +0000 

Attachments: NES_Amex_TWC_11,1_201.09_020816.pdf 

Here is the bill for Time Warner 11J in case you need to call and trouble shoot... 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: bellaklein 
Subject: Re: From Ehud and Nili in 11J - bill attached 
Date: February 5, 2016 at 10:44:50 AM EST 
To: 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Feb 5, 2016, at 10:44 AM, bellaklein  > wrote: 

called TWC, they reset cable box and don't see any problems. Attached is the latest bill with all info on it. If 
there is a problem, they have to call directly to troubleshoot 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Feb 5, 2016, at 8:07 AM, 

Ok 

Sent from my iPhone 

wrote: 

On Feb 5, 2016, at 8:04 AM, Bella Klein ctl > wrote: 

Will call later when in the office .. 

EFTA00329171



Thank you, 

Bella 

On Feb 4, 2016, at 8:14 PM, l==la wrote: 

Hi Bella. Below from Nili! 

sorry to bother you again. but we do not have TV. yesterday it was OK. now it doesn't. :( 

Sent from my iPhone 

EFTA00329172


