
From: Lesley Groff <a> 
To: Bernard Kruger < IMMI > 
Cc: Rich Kahn 

Subject: Re: Renewal for 12.2015- 12.2016 
Date: Thu, 21 Jan 2016 01:21:22 +0000 

Super. Thx 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Jan 20, 2016, at 7:24 PM, Bernard Kruger .t: > wrote: 

> • We are just ironing out details hope to open April will keep you informed 

> Sent from my iPhone 

>> On Jan 20, 2016, at 5:46 PM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 
>> 
>> Jeffrey is asking when can we sign up for emergency care 10k for all ... 
>> 
>> Sent from my iPhone 
>> 
>>> On Jan 20, 2016, at 4:08 PM, Bernard Kruger < wrote: 
>>> 
>>> Lesley, 
>>> Jeffrey called last week and said he was renewing. Bernard 
>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>> 
>>>> On Jan 20, 2016, at 3:40 PM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 
>>>> 
>>>> Thank you. Will let you know! 
>>>> 
>>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>>> 
>>>>> On Jan 20, 2016, at 3:33 PM, Bernard Kruger > wrote: 
>>>>> 
>>>» Dear Lesly, 
>>>>> 
>>>>> As per our conversation, I am attaching the renewal invoice for Mr. Jeffery Epstein for 
the 2016 yearly retainer. Please let me know if he will be renewing for the year 2016 and if 
you have any questions regarding the concierge service let me know! 
>>>>> 
>>>>> Thanks, 
>>>>> Wendy 
>>>>> 
>>>>> 
>>>>> 
>>>>> The Office of Bernard Kruger, M.D. 
>>>» 170 East 78th Street 
>>>>> New York, NY 10075 
>>>>> T: F: 
>>>>> <JEFFREY EPSTEIN.doc> 

EFTA00330561


