
From: Lesley Graf  
To: Bella Klein cl 

Subject: Re: NES Acct#: C700713 CarsCo, Inc. 
Date: Thu, 21 Jan 2016 16:42:28 +0000 

ok...you should ask them to send the receipts to your email address as I know they have mine on file...! 

On Jan 21, 2016, at 11:29 AM, bellaklein  > wrote: 

Hi Les, 
Forgot to copy you on my email to CarsCo.. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin fonvarded message: 

From: bellaklein < 
Subject: NES Acct#: C700713 CarsCo, Inc. 
Date: January 21. 2016 at 11:27:47 AM EST 
To: mycarsco@mycarsco.com 

reference: 

NES Acct#: C700713 

Please provide receipts for the charges on our Amex as the date of the charge is different from reservation 
and service date. List of charges attached. 

01/01/2016 CARSCO TAXI ENGLEWOOD CLI NJ 62.32taxi 
12/24/2015 CARSCO TAXI ENGLEWOOD CLI NJ 62.32taxi 
12/22/2015 CARSCO TAXI ENGLEWOOD CLI NJ 70.11taxi 
12/21/2015 CARSCO TAXI ENGLEWOOD CLI NJ 78.31taxi 
12/19/2015 CARSCO TAXI ENGLEWOOD CLI NJ 70.11taxi 
12/19/2015 CARSCO TAXI ENGLEWOOD CLI NJ 78.31taxi 

12/14/2015 CARSCO TAXI ENGLEWOOD CLI NJ 62.32taxi 
12/14/2015 CARSCO TAXI ENGLEWOOD CLI NJ 78.31taxi 
12/13/2015 CARSCO TAXI ENGLEWOOD CLI NJ 54.12taxi 

Thank you very much for your help, 
Bella 
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