From: "Michelle" <
To: "Lesley Grofr” - -

Subject: RE: Cancel john Saturday
Date: Fri, 15 Jan 2016 14:45:38 +0000

Mills, Chic.

He is currently working for an estate in Gat
Michellae

Employment Counselor
Eegal Domestics, Inc.

rax

————— Original Message-----

From: Lesley Groff :mailto:_]
Sent: Friday, January 15, 2016 9:42 AM

To: Barbara Goldman
Zubject: Re: Cancel john Saturday

Yes, sorry about this...sounds fine on adding the $75 insurance cost Lo
John based?

on Jan 15, 2016, at 9:39 aM, Michelle <[ S

wrote:
> Hi Lesley,

> We are sorry to hear about this., I'wve already talked with John and

> canceled the meeting. It is a good thing he bought insurance for the
> tickets =0 he can get a refund. The insurance cost was 575 and I told
> him we'll just add it to the cost of the tickets again when he

» purchases another once we are able to reschedule his interview.

> He is free next weekend if that 1= good time for Mr. Epstein.

> Let me know.

> Thank you,

> Michelle

» Employment Counselor
> Regal Domestics, Inc.

B o————- Criginal Message-----

» From: Lesley Groff [mallto :_]
> Sent: Thursday, January 14, 201lae 8:03 PM

> Tao: Barbara Goldman

> Subject: Cancel john Saturday

> Hi michelle. 5S¢ sorry but Jeffreys schedule has changed and we need to

> cancel Johns face to face. Hope to reschedule soon. Lesley

> Sent from my iFhone

next tix...where iz
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