From: Lesley Groff <] -
To: Barbara Goldman <

Subject: Re: Eric Krempp's Reimbursement

Date: Fri, 15 Jan 2016 20:39:46 +0000

I will have to ask Jeffrey...not sure!
on Jan 15, 2016, at 3:37 pM, Michelle <[ :ot-:
*» Glad to hear about Eric! We really think he is a terrific chef.

> Any word about the couple in Florida? Mrs. Goldman was asking 1f you want us
» to refrain from sending them elsewhere for now?

» Michelle

> Employment Counselor
> Regal Domestics, Inc.

» Sent: Friday, Januvary 15, Z01& 3:33 FM
» To: Barbara Goldman
Fe: Eric Erempp's Reimbursement

> ok, thanks...I just saw Eric and got his address and passed it along to our
> accounting dept....
> I think =o far so good...Jeffrey keeping him on his toes...switching the 5
> person lunch to a perscn lunch then, at 11:30, he told Eric he wanted

» italian food for the lpm lunch (that was scheduled for Zpm) instead of the
> fish that was discussed yesterday... This can all ke VERY typical! Eric

» will also prepare dinner tonight for 7! ... I just ate a dessert Eric made
> and it was incredible...
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» thanks, Lesley

> on Jan 15, 2016, at 3:27 eM, Michelle <G -

» wrote:
»» Hi Lesley,

=» You can just send everything to him directly. We are not charging Mr.
»» Epstein a fee for the one day trial.

#» How did Eric do today?

> Michelle

== Employment Counselor
»» Regal Domestics, Inc.
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————— COriginal Message-----

From: Lesley Greff [mailto: |G
Sent: Friday, Januwary 15, 201a 3:13 PM

To: Barbara Goldman

Subject: Eric Krempp's Reimbursement

Hi Michelle...where should we send Eric's reimbursement check once it
iz written? I would think we can send to him early next week...but I

didn't knaw if it needs to go to yeou first or where?

Thanks, Lesley
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