
From: "Girard, Jean (WFC)" 
To: Lesley Groff 

Subject: RE: Enhanced Education Conf. Room Feb. 15-19,2016 
Date: Mon, 23 Nov 2015 23:37:24 +0000 

The room is yours of course!-

 Original Message 
From: Lesley Groff [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, November 23, 
To: Girard, Jean (WFC) 
Subject: Re: Enhanced Education Conf. Room Feb. 15-19,2016 

I'm totally able to wait! I just wanted to make sure we wouldn't lose the room actually...if 
its fine on your end, then all good with me :) 

Thanks, Lesley 

On Nov 23, 2015, at 5:49 PM, Girard, Jean (WFC) wrote: 

> Hello Lesley, 

> Given the busy Xmas season, our accounting is probably behind.. 
> Do you need this to be processed right away or are you able to wait? 
> Let me know, either way I will make it happen.. 
> jean 

• Original Message 
> From: Lesley Groff 
> Sent: Monday, November 23, 2015 1:47 PM 
> To: Girard, Jean (WFC) 
> Subject: Re: Enhanced Education Conf. Room Feb. 15-19,2016 

> • Hi Jean...just checking in...I still have not seen this deposit hit my credit card? Do you 
know when you will put through the deposit? 

> Thanks, Lesley 

> On Nov 17, 2015, at 3:49 PM, Girard, Jean (WFC) wrote: 

>> I have thank you Lesley! 
» Jean 
>> 
>>  Original Message 
>> From: Lesley Groff [mailto: 
>> Sent: Tuesday, November 17, 
>> To: Girard, Jean (WFC) 
>> Subject: Enhanced Education Conf. Room Feb. 15-19,2016 
>> 
>> Hi Jean..I sent you the last page of the contract signed & Dated as well as sent you the 
$1500 deposit from the secure web page you sent...can you please confirm you receive both for 
me? 
>> 
» Thank you, 
» Lesley 
>> 
>> 
>> This communication is the property of FRHI Hotels & Resorts and contains confidential 
information intended only for the persons to whom it is addressed. If you have received this 
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message in error, please immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy the original 
message and all copies. 
> 
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